RESOLUTION NO. 1998- 14

AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS WITH GAHR MACHINE COMPANY,
DAVID GRINN, EDWARD J. JOSCELYN, AND THOMAS OLSON FOR
THE SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS EQUIPMENT, AS LISTED, IN AN
“AS 18" CONDITION FOR A TOTAL PURCHASE PRICE OF EIGHTEEN
THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FORTY-SEVEN & 00/100 DOLLARS
($18,547.00).

WHEREAS, the miscellaneous items listed in the Attachment hereto have been
determined to be obsolete and/or in such a state of disrepair that it would not be to the
Authority's advantage to have them repaired, and

WHEREAS, the bids of three individuals and one company as listed in said
Attachment for said miscellaneous equipment was received on the 18th day of January, 1998,
and

WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the bids of herein named individuals
and companies to be the highest responsive bids from responsible bidders for the items
indicated and recommends acceptance thereof by the Board of Trustees.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the Greater
Cleveland Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio:

Section 1. That the bid of GAHR Machine Company, whose address is 19199
St. Clair Avenue, Cleveland, Ohio 44117-1090 for the purchase of Reference ltem #1 as listed
on the Attachment hereto for a total purchase price of seventeen thousand & 00/100 doliars
($17,000.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid from a
responsible bidder for this item.

Section 2. That the bid of David Grinn, whose address is 845 Rosewood Dr.,
Brunswick, Ohio 44122 for the purchase of Reference Items #2, 3, 4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9, 12, 13, 14,
15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, and 26 as listed on the Attachment hereto for a total purchase
price of one thousand twelve & 00/100 dollars ($1,012.00) be and the same is hereby accepted
as the sole responsive bid from a responsive bidder for these items.

Section 3. That the bid of Edward J. Joscelyn, whose address is PO Box 41,
Ringoes, NJ, 08551 for the purchase of Reference Item #25 as listed on the Attachment hereto
for a total purchase price of three hundred ten & 00/100 dollars ($310.00) be and the same is
hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid from a responsible bidder for this item

Section 4. That the bid of Thomas Olson, whose address is 14108 Courtland
Avenue, Cleveland, Ohlo 44111, for the purchase of Reference Item #10 as listed on the
Attachment hereto for a total purchase price of two hundred twenty-five & 00/100 dollars
($225.00) be and the same is hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid from a
responsible bidder for this item.

Section 5. That the General Manager of the Authority be and he is hereby
authorized to enter into a contract with GAHR Machine Company, David Grinn, Edward J.
Joscelyn and Thomas Olson listed for the sale of items of said miscellaneous equipment as
identified herein on such terms as are in the interest of the Authority.
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Section 6. That the proceeds of said sale in the amount of eighteen thousand
five hundred forty-seven & 00/100 dollars ($18,547.00) be deposited into the General Fund.

Section 7. That this resolution shall become effective immediately upon its
adoption.

Attachment: IFB #87160 Bid Award

Adopted: February 17 , 1998 Y)
4 4 i Presid71t
Attest: WWA

General M nagerISec etary-Treasurer
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IFB # 87160 BID AWARD
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GCRTA IFE# 97160 EID AWARD Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Bidder Biddar
REF# DESCRIFTION : Ed Joscelyn | DaveGrinn NATSGO | RM. Herrera . B. Banta GAHR T. Olson
1 ICHEGAGC BRAKE (PREIS & KRUMP) 50 TON METAL BRAKE MNoBid| § 1,287.00 No Bid No 8id No Bid| $ 17,000.00 No Bid
2  [1974 PLASSER UYT SWITCH & SPOT TAMPER NoBid| § 750.00 : No Bid No Bid:% No Bid| Mo Bidl Nc Bid
3 DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE ASSEMELY #1 No Bid| $ 5.0 No Bid] Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |PETROIT DIESEL ENGINE ASSEMBLY #2 NeBid| $ 5.00 No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid, No Bid
5 |DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE ASSEMBLY NoBid| $ 75.00 No Bid No Bid- No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 [ALLISON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION NoBid & 8.00 No Bid No Bik No Bld No Bid No Bid
7 |ALLISON AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 1 NoBld| § a.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | Ne Bid
8 STWO (2) MAGNA LIFT CLEANING MACHINES NoBld $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid| - No Bid No B:d Nc Bid
9 [EIGHT (8) WINDOW A/C UNITS WITHOUT CABINETS Ne Bid| $ 4.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
¢ IGRAVELY GRASS CUTTER/SNOW BLOWER WITH ATTACHMEN NoBid] § 8500 ; No Bid| $ 125003 157950 No Bid| 225.00
11 [ONE (1) SMALL WATER FOUNTAR WITHOUT CABINET No Bid No Bid No Bid: Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bd Nao Bid
12 [FOUR {4) USED BOBCAT TIRES 10-16.5 NHS SPLY TUBELESS No Bl $ 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 ITWQ (2) USED WILDCAT TIRES CALCIUM FILLED 26x12-12 NHS NoBid| § 2.00 ; No Bid No Bid!' No Bid: Ne Bid- No Bid}
14 |ONE (1) USED WILDCAT TIRE CALCIUM FILLED 26x12-12 GENE Np Bidj $ 1.00 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bxd No Bid
15 ‘KENRO VERTICAL 467" CAMERA (POOR CCNDITION -FOR PA No Bidj § 1.00 No Bid No Bld Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
15 [ITEX GRAPHI(X 430 CAMERA PROCESSOR (PCOR CONDITION) No Bid: $ 4.00 No Bid No Bid] No Bid® po Bid No Bid
17 |ITEK 435 CAMERA PROCESSOR (BROKEN, PARTS ONLY) No Bid| $ 1.00 No Bid No 8 Mo Bid No Bid Na Bid
13 .AB DICK 360 PRINTING PRESS NoBd| § 1.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bid
19 |ACMENISIELE STATCMATIC STAT MACHINE (NON-FUNCTION Ne Bid: $ 1.00 Nc Bid No Bid No Bid;_ No Bid; No Bid
20 'AE DICK PRINTING PRESS (FAIR CONDITION) NoBid| § 25.00 No Bid| Ne Bid MNo Bid No Bid No Bid
21 .TOWLIFT {4000 LB. CAPACITY) (PODR CONDITION) No Bid| § 2500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE ASSEMBLY No Bid- § 75.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Biid No Bid No Bid
23 SONY COMPUTER MOMITOR (17 INCH) No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
24 '[TWO (2) VULTROM VIDEC CONTROLLER UNIT No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid Mo Bid
25 TOWER CITY CENTRAL CONTROL TRAFFIC MACHINE WIRELA | §  310.00 S 5.00 No Bid: No Bid} No Bld No Bid| No Bid
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|FB # 97160 BID AWARD

GCRTA IFB#STIE0BIDAWARD |  Buacer | Bioder | Biager Bidder Bidger Bidder Bidder
REF &, DESCR\?W‘_E)N_ R ! Ec  agmaral __C_ ave (;mn__r:_ _EA_T_S_CO R.N.Herrera | B. Banla GAHR T. Olson
:
25 [LINGOLN RIDING FLOOR SCRUBBER (RTA# OE-05-0065) NoBd|§  40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 iBM ELECTRONIC TYPEWRITER (GREEN) No Bid No Bid| No Bid" No Bid No Eid No Bid Mo Bid
26 |RADIO SHACK VIDEO MONITOR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid, No Bid No Bid
28 |RADIO SHACK KEY BOARD No Bid Mo Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 |[MITSUBISHI EAX MACHINE No Bid] No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid’ No &d
31 |ELECTRONIC ROLODEX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |EXCN OFFICE SYSTEM , SERIES 500 INFORMATION PROCESS No Bid; No Bid No Bid: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
» MONITOR 18.5 KH :
* PRINTER MODEL SPRINT 10x35 i
*» DISK DRIVE ¢
! = KEY BOARD
33 |MICRO DESIGN VIEWER No Bid; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nc Bid
34 TYPEWRITER; |EM : No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No &id No Bid Ne Bid
a5 |LIGHT ASSEMBLY (3) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 |FOUR (4) BOOK SHELF, SINGLE FOR WORK STATION No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bid
; Aword) S 310.00{§ 101200 $ 17.00000 -§  225.00
Deposit| § 620018  477.80 § 2500(%  31.40:§ 340000 (S 4500
Baincel §  24800(S 53420 s 25.00! 3140 | S 12500005  180.00
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