RESOLUTION NO. 1998- 15

AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS WITH WOOSTER IRON & METAL COMPANY AND
TRANSIT SALES INTERNATIONAL FOR THE SALE OF FIFTY-ONE (51) USED
REVENUE VEHICLES IN AN "AS 1S" CONDITION FOR A TOTAL PURCHASE PRICE
OF SIXTEEN THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED TWELVE & 08/100 DOLLARS
($16,312.08).

WHEREAS, the vehicles listed in the Attachment hereto have been determined to be
obsolete in accordance with Authority's vehicle replacement policy; and

WHEREAS, the bids listed on the Attachment for said vehicles were received on the
28th day of January, 1998; and

WHEREAS, the General Manager deems the bids of herein named companies to be the
highest responsive bids from responsible bidders and recommends acceptance thereof by the
Board of Trustees.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Trustees of the Greater
Cleveland Regional Transit Authority, Cuyahoga County, Ohio:

Section 1. That the bid of Wooster Iron and Metal Company , whose address is P.O.
Box 1289, Wooster, Ohio 44691, for the purchase of forty-six (46} vehicles as listed on the
Attachment hereto for a total purchase price of eleven thousand two hundred sixty-two &
08/100 doliars ($11,262.08) be and the same is hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid
from a responsible bidder.

Section 2. That the bid of Transit Sales International, whose address is 1863 Service
Court, Riverside, CA 92507 for the purchase of five (5) vehicles as listed on the Attachment
hereto for a total purchase price of five thousand fifty & 00/100 dollars ($5,050.00) be and the
same is hereby accepted as the highest responsive bid from a responsibie bidder.

Section 3. That the General Manager of the Authority be and he is hereby authorized to
enter into contracts with the companies as listed on the Attachment hereto which is
incorporated herein for the sale of said vehicles as described on such terms as are in the
interest of the Authority.

Section 4, That the proceeds of said sale in the amount of sixteen thousand three
hundred twelve & 08/100 dollars ($16,312.08) be deposited into the General Fund.

Section 5. That this resolution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption.

Attachment: IFB 97159 Awards Analysis

- Adopted: February 17 , 1998
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IFB 97159 AWARDS ANALYSIS

COACH | MAKE | WMODEL | SERIALNUMBER | YEAR | MILEAGE | BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

R ' i L ; Waoster Iron & Metal | David Grinn | Transit Szles Int.
' |

8223 | GMC T80-204 | 1GOYTB2J4CVE21069 | 1982 | 549772 1§ _266.08 % 6.00 No Bid
8248 | GMC T80-204 | 1GOYT82J5CVE21095 | 1982 | 511,307 : ¢ 226.08 | 3 5.00 No Bid
8263 | GMC T80-204 | 1GOYT82J1CV821109 | 1982 | 530,895 & § 226.06 | $ 5.00 No Bid
8272 | GMC T80-204 | 1GOYT82J2CVE21118 | 1982 | 629.654 |§ 89.26 | $ 5.00 _ No Bid
B374 | FLXIBLE | METRO | 1GF5AGEK2DE095709 1983 | 253974 | 289.25 | $ 5.00 | No Bid
8375 | FLXIBLE | METRO | 1GFGAGEKODE095710. 1983 | 255.500 15 389.26 | $ 5.00 No Bid
00| FUUBLE | METRO | 1GFEAGAKBDFOO7112] 1985 | 448,026 |$ _ ___ 189.26|$ 5001 Nobid
8502 | FLXIBLE | METRO | 1GFSAGKXDF097113 | 1985 | 436,044 |s 389.26 | 5 506 |5 1,010.00
8507 | FLXIBLE | METRO | 1GF5AGAKSDF097118 | 1985 | 455574 1§ 38926 |$ 500  NoBid
810 | FLXIBLE | METRO | 1GF5AGAKIDFD97121| 1985 | 433911 § 389.26 | $ 5.00 No Bid_
8512 | FIXIBLE | METRO | 1GFSAGAK2DF097123| 1985 | 465338 14 3822615 500  NoBid
8516 : FLXIBLE : METRO | 1GFSAGAKXDF097127| 1985 | 468045 |s 189.26 | 5 5.00 | $ 1,010.00
8517 ! FLXBLE | METRO [ 1GFSAGAKIDFO97128| 1985 | 465330 (S 26.26 | S 5.00 No Bid
8563 : FLXIBLE | METRO  : 1GFSAGAKSDF097174| 1985 | 423469 | & 389.26 |[S 500 _ NoBid
8607 | SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER | 01983032510279660 1984 239455 | § 551.26 { $ 5.00 Nc Bid
5605 |skiLLCRAFT T_RANSMASTER} 0198305311031950_5 1984 | 218,056 |[$ _ 95126 1§ 5001 NobBid
3606 | SKILLCRAFT TRANSMASIERE O1883061310329605 | 1984 238622 | § 551.26 | $ 5.00 No Bid
9608 | SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER| O19830705103496508 | 1984 | 216,167 |§ 551.26 | $ 5.00 No Bid
9610 _|SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER| O1983081510369610 | 1984 | 236,091 | 551.26 | 5.00 No Bid
9612 ISKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER| O1983091510389612 | 1984 | 228480 | $ 551.26 | 5.00 No Bid
9613 | SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER| O1983092310399613 1884 | 196,966 | $ 551.26 | $ 5.00 No Bid
9622 | SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER! O1984071010659622 | 1984 | 173,587 |8 251.26 | 5 500|  NoBid
8625 [SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER 019840829_10_689625 1' 1984 197,437 | § 25126 | $ 5.00 No Bid
8626 | SKILLCRAFT| TRANSMASTER| 01984083110699626 ! 1984 | 203,096 | $ _251.28 | § 5.00 No Bid
Total Award | § 11,262.08 $  5,050.00
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IFB 87153 AWARDS ANALYSIS

COACH | MAKE | MODEL .  SERIAL NUMBER | YEAR | MILEAGE BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Woosler Ircn & Metal | David Grinn & Transit Sales Int.
4108 | GMC | T8H203 .  T8H203424 1879 | 540795 |§ 126.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4121 | GMC ; TeH-203 |  T8H203436 1979 | 481,175 [§ 126.08 | § 5.00 No Bid
4126 ¢ GMC T8H-203 ! T8H203441 1979 | 512,855 |s 126.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4147 1 GMC | TeH203 1 TeH203462 | 1979 | 314001 |5 83.08 | 9 5.00 No Bid
4152 | GMC | T8H203 - T8H203467 1979 | 430425 |8 226.08 | § 5.00 No Bid
4161 | GMC | TBH-203 | .T8H203478 1979 | 449550 | s 226.08 | 3 5.00 No Bid
4184 | GMC | T8H203 |  T8H203479 1979 ! 430301 |§ 17608 |S 540 _ No Bid
4179 GMC T8H-203 | T8H203494 1979 | 449508 |$ '89.08 | $ 5.00 N Bid
4194 | GMC | T8H-203 .. TeH203509 1979 | 546061 |[s 83.08 | 3 5.00 No Bid
4197 § GMC | T8H-203 T8H203512 1979 | 587,916 |§ 126.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4203 | @eMC | TBH-203 T8H203525 | 1979 | 514537 | 126.08 | 3 ' 5.00 No Bid
4210 * GMC | T8H-203 T8H203525 1 1979 | 580475 |$ 126.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4213 | GMC | T8H-203 T8H203528 1979 | 550643 | $ © 226.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4216 | GWMC | TeH-203 |  TeH203531 1979 | 545152 |§ 126.08 | 3 5.00 No Bid
4218 | GMC | TeH-203 T8H203533 1979 | 350975 |$ 126.08 | $ 500{  NoBid
4230 | GMC | TeH203 T8H203545 1979 | -499057 |$ 126.08 | $ 5.00 | No Bid
4236 | oMC | TeH-203 T8H203549 1979 | 512,356 | § 126.08 | $ 5.00 No 8id
4238 | GMC | TaH-203 T8H203553 | 1979 | 475520 | 89.08 | $ 5.00 No Bid
4240 | GMC | TeH203 TBH203555 | 1979 | 483310 | $ 126.08 | $ 500|%  1,010.00
4245 | GMC | TeH-z03 T8H203560 | 1979 | 490466 |$ .08 |5 5.00 No Bid
4246 | GMC | TaH-203 T8H203561 1979 | 474518 | § 12608 | § 5.00 No Bid
4248 | GMC | TaH-203 T8H203563 1979 | 506,996 |§ 126.08 | $ 5005  1,010,00
4255 | GMC | TBH-203 T8H203570 1979 | 491,083 |$ 12608 |$ 5.00 No Bid
8208 | GMC | T8O-204 | 1GOYT82J2CV621054 | 1982 | 505742 | $ 126.08 | 3 500[$ 14,0100
8209 | GMC | 780204 | 1GOYTB2J4CVE21055 | 1982 | 487,846 | $ 126.08 | § 5.00 No Bid
8216 | GMC | T80-204 | 1GOYT82J1Cv821062 | 1982 | 525682 |$ 226.08 | § 5.00 No Bid
8219 | GMC | T80-204 | 1GOYTB2J7CV821065 | 1982 | 612039 |3 226.08 | § 5.00 Nc Bid
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